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New $450,000 Lambert Rd. assured by Fall 
Reconstruction of Lambert Rd. 

will begin this summer. 

The County Board of Supervisors 
accepted Lambert Rd. into the 
County highway system at a 
meeting Tuesday. The proposed 
resurfacing project will cost 
$450,000. 

The project area is Roosevelt 
Rd. south to the Foxcroft Sub¬ 
division (not to Butterfield Rd. 
because Foxcroft is already paved 
and blacktopped). 

The reconstruction will be done 
in two phases. The first phase will 

is June 9 
The IRC announced Wednesday 

the deadline for returning books 
has been extended to June 9. If 
books are not returned then, a hold 
will be placed on student’s tran¬ 
scripts until the book is returned or 
paid for. There is no fine for late 
books. 

Tentative IRC hours for the 
summer quarter will be: 

Monday through Thursday, 7:45 

a.m. to 10 p.m. 
Friday: 7:45 a.m. to 4:30 p.m. 
Saturday: 8 a.m. to 12 noon. 

Sunday: 1 p.m. to 5 p.m. 

All normal services offered 
throughout the year, such as 
equipment delivery, film rental 
and equipment check-outs, will 
continue through the summer. 

last only two or three weeks. 
Twenty-second St. to Foxcroft 
Subdivision will be closed for this 
period. This area will be covered 
with blacktop. 

After this surface is laid and can 
be traveled upon, the northern 
sector of Lambert Rd. will be 
closed. This area is Roosevelt Rd. 
to 22nd St. This second phase will 
not be completed until late Sep¬ 
tember. Included in this second 
phase will be resurfacing, a gutter, 
and curb installed on either side of 
the road. Also the road will be 
widened to 36 feet. 

Processing results of the ap¬ 
plications will be mailed on or 
before July 24, 1970. 

The ISSC grant will pay for 
tuition fees for a student who 
shows financial need. Students 
may obtain applications in the 
Financial Aids & Placement Of¬ 
fice, K136. Students are urged to 
apply for these grants as soon as 
possible. 

Picnic time!!! 

A student-faculty softball 

game will be featured at this 
Sunday's C of D picnic, to be 

held at the Arie Crown Forest 
Preserve just off Mannheim 
Rd. in La Grange. The af¬ 
ternoon picnic will begin with 
buffet luncheon at 1 p.m. 

In addition Roosevelt Rd. will be 
widened to five lanes at the 
Lambert Rd. intersection with a 
traffic control signal for safer left 
turns. Glen Ellyn will complete 
this portion of the project. 

The action taken Tuesday ends 
more than two years of 
negotiations over who should bear 
costs of improving the highway 
that leads to the Interim Campus. 

The road construction costs will 
be paid by funds from the State 
Highway Department and four 
taxing bodies: Glen Ellyn, the 
County Highway Department, 
Milton Township, and College of 
DuPage. 

Graduates 
can subscribe 
to Courier 
Graduating students and 

retiring staff may subscribe to 
The Courier for $2.50 for the 
academic year, it was an¬ 
nounced Wednesday. 

The subscription rate covers 
mailing costs for at least 30 
issues. Checks should be made 
out to The Courier. 

Those who subscribe this 
month will also receive sum-> 
mer issues. 

Randy Meline gets 
Courier editorship 

Randy Meline, city editor of The 
Courier, has been named editor for 
the coming academic year, the 
newly-created publications board 
announced Wednesday. 

He will succeed Robert Baker, 
who plans to transfer to Nor¬ 
thwestern University. 

New film stars 
Rolling Stones 

The first area showing of the 
Rolling Stones in Jean-Luc 
Godard’s Sympathy for the Devil 
will be held in the Campus Center 
Saturday, June 6. There will be 
showings at 3, 7:30 and 10 p.m. 

A new sound system will be 
installed for the performances. 

Student films produced for 
Cinema 103 and Media 103 will be 
shown after the 7:30 and 10 p.m. 
performances. The student 
productions will also be shown 
from 8 a.m. to 7p.m. Tuesday in K- 
113. 

Ronald Dold, County Highway 
Superintendent, said that the 
cooperation of the four taxing 
bodies shows they can work 
together to get things done that 
best serve the interest of the 
community. 

The County Highway Depart¬ 
ment and college officials 
remarked how well the road did 
withstand construction trucks, 
approximately 6,000 students’ 
cars, plus local traffic for 2% 
years. The road was only built to 
serve a few farm houses. 

By Ralph Guglielmucci 

List of graduates on Page 3 

Friday, June 5, will mark this 
year’s commencement exercises 
for those who have worked hard 
for two years at College of 
DuPage. 

Graduates will assemble at 6:30 
p.m. in the Campus Center and at 
7:30 the procession will form for 
entrance into the gymnasium. 

A reception will follow the 
ceremonies in the Campus Center 
at 9:15 p.m. and there will be 
dancing from 10:15 until 12 mid¬ 
night. 

Three years ago the county and 
Glen Ellyn improved Park Blvd. to 
four lanes to serve the permanent 
campus that will be located along 
Park Blvd. 

College officials will construct 
22nd St. from Park Blvd. west to 
the extension of 22d St. adjacent to 
the Interim Campus. Under long- 
range plans 22nd St. will serve the 
entire western area from the 
lakefront (Lake Michigan) to a 
point west of Wheaton. 

The dance is for graduates and 
guests, by ticket only. Tickets for 
the dance will be included in the 
diploma folder which graduates 
will receive at the commencement 
exercises. 

Dr. Walter H. Judd will be the 
principal speaker at com¬ 
mencement. Dr. Judd, former 
Minnesota Congressman, is also a 
noted lecturer, physician, and 
medical missionary. 

Dress will be as follows: Men 
wear suit and tie or sport jacket 
and tie. Women wear conventional 
appropriate dress. 
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Grant deadline June 20 
The Illinois State Scholarship 

Commission is re-opening the 
opportunity to be considered for a 
monetary award for 1970-71. 
Students must have their ap¬ 
plications completed and returned 
to the Illinois State Scholarship 

IRC deadline 
lor book return 

Commission postmarked no later 
than June 20, 1970. Applications 
postmarked after that date that 
will not be considered. 

It is the Commission’s hope that 
all students who have financial 
need as determined by the Com¬ 
mission and who meet the June 20 
deadline will be assisted. If any 
restriction is necessary, however, 
applications will receive con¬ 
sideration based on date received 
in the ISSC office. 

Friday night is graduation; 
reception, dance to follow 

Experimental college to begin operation this summer 
By Barbara Andrae 

Alpha-One, the experimental 
college within College of DuPage, 
will begin operation during the 
summer quarter. Interviews have 
been held in which students and 
faculty have been free to question 
prospective faculty members. 

Students interested in attending 
Alpha-One should contact their 
adviser. A special program for 
each individual is designed by the 
student and his adviser. 

The new director is James 
Gulden, who is working for his Ph.- 

D. degree at the University of 
Illinois at Urbana. He received his 
B.A. at Central Washington State 
college and his M.A. from 
California State College, Los 
Angeles. 

Students may register in units of 
five quarter hours. 

There are five basic approaches 
to learning under Alpha-One: 

1. Free study-By working in¬ 
dependently or with others, the 
student is free to explore ideas, 
attempt creative projects, and 
follow his intellectual curiosity. 

2. Educational advising, tutorial 
and small group experiences-This 
offers the opportunity to plan a 
course of study with others, 
deciding what you want to learn, 
how you want to learn, and how 
you want to measure your 
progress. Compare your attitudes 
with those of your contemporaries. 

3. Problem Centered-You can 
check out your thinking about a 
problem against “experts” and 
fellow students. 

4. Standard classroom-If you 
feel you will learn best in a stan¬ 
dard classroom situation, your 

adviser will help you find a way to 
use this method. 

5. Prescribed study-A clear-cut 
set of objectives and a plan for 
reaching the final goal may be 
useful in understanding the sub¬ 
ject. Working at your own rate 
increases understanding. 

Any of these approaches may be 
used or combined. What your 
approaches will be and where you 
take them depend on you. Each 
individual’s program is developed 
around him. 

The underlying idea of Alpha- 
One is freedom-freedom to ex¬ 

plore attitudes and ideas, new 
approaches to learning, and the 
freedom to learn by doing. In 
Alpha a student may receive credit 
for working with Operation 
Breadbasket or a community 
organization. 

The staff of Alpha-One has been 
chosen by interviews in which both 
students and faculty have par¬ 
ticipated. At this time, the faculty 
includes Mrs. Dorothy Black, 
Robert Brockob, Ed Dewell, Miss 
Cynthia Ingols, William Leppert, 
and Ted Tilton. Several more are 
to be added. 
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Letters letters letters letters letters letters letters letters letters lette 
To The Editor: 

An asserted effort, of a most 
critical nature, is necessary for 
our term in office to be a suc¬ 
cessful one. We already are beset 
with * very critical problem, that 
one being, not having a senate to 
work with because of the lack of 
interest shown in the last election. 
We forsee many other problems 
unless you in the student body at 
large will help us plan a relevant 
and coherent program for next 
year. So again, I come to you with 
my campaign cry “Come 
Together!” 

As I’ve stated before time and 
time again, this executive board 
doesn’t really plan to make any 
decisions without first getting your 
ideas and opinions. Now is the time 
for those ideas and opinions, no 
matter how asinine they may seern 
to you. Without response on your 
part, we will be forced to act and 
I’m sure we will hear that old 
College of DuPage cry: “Student 
Government is a farce.” 

At present, I am beset with a 
problem of finding interested 
individuals to serve on committees 
for next year. To put this in 
numbers, I am speaking of ap¬ 
proximately 200-250 people in 
sitting down and negotiating with 
the administration and faculty. 
There seems to be growing con¬ 
cern for students to become in¬ 
volved within the decision making 
as far as our educational system is 
concerned. We are trying with all 
our might to get interested 
students involved in areas with 
“voting power” so our views will 
be adhered to in the future. An 
example of this is the Curriculum 
Council which would like ten 
students with “voting power” to 
work with them. At present I only 
have five. But yet, you can bet next 
year there will be those individuals 
moaning and groaning because 
they have to take certain courses 
when now they have a chance to 
voice an opinion on what they 
would like to take. This is only one 
area and there are many others. 

Unfortunately, I cannot get out and 
speak to each and every individual 
student and ask what area he or 
she would be interested in working 
in. So I ask you, if you are in¬ 
terested, come to the Student 
Government office any time 
during the day, leave your name, 
where you can be contacted, and 
you can be sure we will be in touch 
with you. 

So brothers and sisters, “Come 
Together,” and help us formulate 
a true government here at College 
of DuPage, “of the people, by the 
people, and for the people.” The 
Student Government office will 
always be open for suggestions. 
Please, come in and help us “get it 
together next year.” 

Fred Robinson 
ASB President 

To The Courier: 

The Faculty Senate moved last 
Tuesday (May 26) not to endorse a 
student government proposal to 
dismiss classes to allow students to 
work in the fall general elections. 
They felt that the students were 
not in favor of class dismissals to 
work on the elections. They also 
felt that most students wouldn’t 
profit and that those wishing to be 
involved could get involved 
anyway. The students at the 
College of DuPage should feel 
they’re in the good hands of the 
Faculty Senate and that they 
always have the best interest of the 
students first and foremost in 
every decision they make for us. 
They have decided for us to be 
better popular than right. 

Student government started the 
idea of a campaign vacation. 
Student government passed the 
proposal almost unanimously, and 
sent the proposal to the Faculty 
Senate in the hope that they would 
pass the proposal. If they would 
have done so, the decision to take a 
campaign vacation would have 
been the students’ at the ballot 
box, through a campus-wide 
referendum. No longer is the 

Instrumental group needs 
people for the future 

By Robert Marshall 

Music department 

Plans have already begun to 
provide College of DuPage with 
more Instrumental Music Groups 
for the 70-71 school year. 

Before continuing may I say that 
this year’s Instrumental Groups 
have done a fine job. Much credit 
is due the young people who made 
up the groups and they have 
certainly set a high standard for 
future groups here. 

Plans for the immediate future 
are as follows: 

Marching Band: This I am 
hoping for the most. With the 
abundance of material in our local 
schools that I hope will come to C 
of D, we should have one of the 
finest marching organizations in 
the area. Plans call for new band 
uniforms and equipment to build a 
marching organization. But more 
than anything we need PEOPLE. 
Next year the Music Department 
will be housed on campus. 
Rehearsals will be held Monday 
through Thursday from 12:00 noon 
to 12:50 p.m. We welcome both 
BOYS and GIRLS who play any 
type of wind or percussion in¬ 
strument. 

Also we are seeking TWIRLERS 
and MAJORETTES. If you are 

decision ours. The Faculty Senate 
has “nixed” it from our hands. 

Conrad Szuberla, political 
science instructor, urged the group 
to support the plan saying that it 
was better being right than being 
popular. He seemed to be the only 
faculty member that did. But, 
WHY? ? ? Could it be that the action 
taken by 36 other colleges and 
universities to dismiss classes, so 
that the students’ could actively 
campaign for the candidate of 
their choice, would have 
discouraged them from being 
right? Or does the real answer lie 
in the fact that the faculty is un¬ 
willing to make a 5-day com¬ 
mittment to foster democracy, and 
listen to our political voice on their 
level? Our willingness to take five 
days out of our Christmas vacation 
is apparently not matched by 
theirs. Therefore, it seems real to 
assume, that their long Christmas 
vacation means more to them then 
our concern for changing America, 
by means of the present 
democratic system. 

The choice was originally ours. 
Now, we have no choice, and no 
voice. For them it was better being 
popular than right. For the 
students, and student government, 
it was better to try, but we always 
seem to fail when we try to change 
our situation by using the system. 

When violence occurs when 
attempts through the system fail.. 
.everyone wonders Why? ? ? Maybe 
in the future they will know, and as 
for today?? We’re in the good and 
popular hands of the faculty 
senate. 

Greg Van Dreps 
ASB senator 

produce fear of 
rising prices 
discontent. 

in.latior. with 
a^d general 

To the Editor: 

With regard to the letter that I 
submitted last week to The 

Courier: It was in no way intended 
to place blame for neglect on Fred 
Robinson alone. I could have as 
easily addressed my question to 
Thom O’Donnell, who led us so 
well in our memorial service. The 
point I wished to make was that 
regardless of color or creed, 
students killed in the cause of 
peace and justice are due the same 
respect-and, that all of us were too 
busy to care about our fellow 
students at Jackson State. 

Dennis Fitzmaurice 

interested or know of people I 
should contact, call Mr. Marshall 
at 852-1069. 

Concert Band: This hopefully 
will be a continuation of Marching 
Band. We have, some very good 
music to play. This group will use 
all winds and percussion of the 
Marching Unit, plus special in¬ 
struments such as oboe, bassoon, 
bass clarinet, and also clarinet. We 
have many instruments which 
have been purchased by the 
school, so we can provide a solid 
basis. Again, it requires you — 
PEOPLE. Rehearsal time is the 
same as Marching Band. 

Next year the Stage Band — The 
Musical Pages — will be larger 
and some innovations added. 
Already we are booking 
engagements for this group and a 
fun day in town is being planned. 
Rehearsal is from 1 p.m. to 2:50 
p.m. on Tuesday and Thursday. 

I must repeat — in order to have 
these things the big need is people 
who like to play horns. May I add 
that 2 horn’s of credit can be ob¬ 
tained from performing in any 
Instrumental group. 

Come one, come all! Get in the 
swing — Join a live group — The 
C.O.D. Instrumental Group. 

“6. Invite unnecessary strikes in 
vital industries, encourage civil 
disorders and foster a lenient and 
soft attitude on the part of 
government toward such disor¬ 
ders. 

“7. By specious argument cause 
the breakdown of the old moral 
virtues, honesty, sobriety, self 
restraint, faith in the pledged 
word, ruggedness. 

8. “Cause the registration of all 
firearms on some pretext, with a 
view to confiscating them and 
leaving the population helpless.” 

As you read this could you help 
but consider the world today? 
Maybe it’s just coincidence. 

Bruce Senneke 

To the Editor: 

In May 1919, at Dusseldorf, 
Germany, the Allied Forces ob¬ 
tained a copy of the “Communist 
Rules for Revolution.” Fifty-one 
years later these guidelines are 
still being followed. 

“A. Corrupt the young; get them 
away from religion. Get them 
interested in sex. Make them 
superficial: destroy their 
ruggedness. 

“B. Get control of all means of 
publicity thereby; 

“1. Get people’s minds off their 
government by focusing their 
attention on athletics, sexy books 
and plays, and other trivialities. 

2. Divide the people into hostile 
groups by constantly harping on 
controversial matters of no im¬ 
portance. 

“3. Destroy the peoples faith in 
their nation’s leaders by holding 
them up to contempt, ridicule and 
disgrace. 

“4. Always preach true 
democracy, but seize power as fast 
and ruthlessly as possible. 

“5. By encouraging government 
extravagance, destroy its credit, 

To The Student Body: 

A question I ask myself after 
seeing this year’s voting reaction 
is, “How can any college student 
favor the lowering of the voting 
age when they cannot vote for the 
school representatives that 
represent your views and the 
budget of $148,000.” The excuse 
that you won’t be here next year, 
or you don’t know the candidates is 
about the poorest excuse any idiot 
could come up with. If nothing 
else, one should feel some sort of 
responsibility to fellow students, 
next year’s students not only at 
College of DuPage but students all 
over the world. 

As the year started out, the 
excuse for apathy was the ASB 
President was a “Hippie.” So, in 
turn, that excuse was good enough 
until it was too late, and the new 
ASB President represented such a 
joke and a mock that some people 
began to realize the mistake they 
had made about the so-called 
“Hippie”. Some, even wished the 
“Hippie” was back. Un¬ 
fortunately, the vast majority of 
apathetic students still showed no 
feelings concerning government, 
therefore only hurting themselves 
with their attitude of immaturity 
and selfishness. 

As the year progressed, the 
number of people that really cared 
about you began to rise to a point of 
no return to the old student 
government. I personally was one 
of those people, I knew I could help 
only with your help. But, most of 
the time no one offered. However, 
with still no reaction from the 
majority, I began what I thought 
was the first step in achieving your 
goals without your help. 

First, I attacked the Executive 
B^ard, brought out the fact their 
resp. nsibility belonged to you and 
believe it or not I actually received 
a reaction. 

Another decision, the biggest in 
my life, was the ultimate goal of 
running for president of our 
student body. I, Len Urso, planned 
on changing your attitude and for a 
brief few weeks thought I had done 
it. 

After speaking in over 150 
classrooms, sending out 200 
postcards, various people working 
on armbands, flags, banners, 
signs, platforms, talking and more 
talking there seemed little doubt 
that the goal of a good turn-out was 
a sure thing now. However, the 
reason that I say this was the 
reactions I was getting from all 
kinds of people. Students were 
actually approaching me, talking 
to me, asking questions, saying 
how much they were behind me. It 
was great. It was greater than 
great-it was almost unbelievable 
to comprehend. This, the apathetic 

student body, was reacting- 
because of me. It was what I had 
always wanted to do-people were 
actually interested. Here it comes- 
-the great turn-out-what’s the total 
-who won—about 600 votes out of 
the entire body-I am getting the 
HELL out of student government, I 
thought at first. Then- 

Then, it occurred to me that this 
was what I and others had been 
striving for since our college 
opened. For a short, but wonderful 
time, Len Urso and student 
government accomplished 
something. What few people 
realized (Administrators on down) 
was there was a reaction to the 
campaign, to the governmental 
body at College of DuPage. 

Some things that I learned this 
year cannot be learned in any 
school book in any school in the 
world. A very important fact that 
few people realize: education is 
not just studying, education is not 
just attending class and passing 
with good grades, education is 
anything and everything you can 
learn. And believe me, I have 
learned more through government 
and working on The Courier than 
any other year in my life. Why? 
Because I learned what kind of 
people there are in this world-the 
very same people I will be dealing 
with the rest of my life. For the 
most part, people really are great. 

Len Urso 
ASB Senator 

ASB Presidential 
Candidate 1970 

Out-of-districf 
students urged 
to seek tuition aid 

All students who plan to attend 
College of DuPage this summer or 
next fall but are not residents of 
this district should apply now to 
their local school districts for 
tuition assistance. 

According to James H. Williams, 
director of admissions and student 
accounting, many out-of-district 
students can receive financial 
assistance — known as 
chargebacks — if they apply 
before the deadline, July 1, for the 
1970-71 school year. Students who 
receive a chargeback pay the 
same tuition as local students 
whereas they would have to pay 
$20.00 per credit hour next fall 
without the chargeback. 

RAH-RAH GANG NEEDED 

Tryouts for the 1970-71 
cheerleaders and pom-pom squad 
will be held at 4 p.m. this Friday, 
June 5, in the gym. 

All students, guys and girls, are 
welcome to come and show their 
spirit. For more information 
contact the Student Government 
Office-K 140. 

WANT ADS 
Girl wanted to help with 

housework and ironing 4-5 hours 
per week in LaGrange Park at $2 
hr. 354-3265. 

Used outdoor grill, $4. 834-5445. 

Young college couple looking for 
a place to live from June till 
August can afford about $100 a 
month. Willing to take care of a 
home for the summer for traveling 
owners. Call Charly or Mary Ann 
(469-6459) 
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DuPage's third year 
Graduating students and their 

home towns are as follows: 

ADDISON: Louis Battistoni, 
Emile Bouchez, Michael Buck- 
master, James Burdon, Wayne 
Elwart, Garry Herbord, Fred 
Holzer, Robert Johnson, Michael 
McLennand, Klaus Popko, Russell 
Speciale, Dale Weissmann. 

ANTIOCH: Raymond Westhoff. 

BARTLETT: Larry Raus. 

BENSENVILLE: Allen Am¬ 
brose, Christine Brooks, Thomas 
Dick, William Eagan, Robert 
Kaminski, Thomas Mason, Linda 
McIntyre, Christine Meagher, 
Sam Morris, Raymond Piepen- 
brink, Janith Schwagart, Sue 
Spencer, Richard Sztuk, Gregory 
Yarosh. 

BROOKFIELD: Dennis Bar an, 
James Barr, Howard Bezin, 
Kenneth Bruhn, Glenn Caithamer, 
Gary Chereskin, John Cousineau, 
Mary Folliard, Frank Haisky, 
Terry Hand, Thomas Holub, 
Kathleen Lyons, Richard Macken, 
Dwayne Mead, Dennis Mullarkey, 
Thom O’Donnell, John Valdes, 
Allen Zobjeck. 

CAROL STREAM: Patrick 
Berkos, Gerald Larm. 

CHICAGO: Antonio Chavarria, 
Louis Davis, Kenneth Hahn, 
Kenneth Pilat. 

CLARENDON HILLS: 

Catherine Baughman, Charles 
Bettenhausen, Lowell Dill, Robert 
Firth, Richard Gavin, William 
Hager, Ronnie Jacobs, Arthur 
Kastl, Jerome Kocar, John 
Kokoska, Betty Peterson, 
Theodore Shokes, Duane Starck, 
John Stefanelli, Ellen Stloukal, 
William Ware. 

DOWNERS GROVE: James 
Barry, James Behounek, Thomas 
Blonn, Roger Bruce, Carol 
Burgess, Bruce Chennell, Thomas 
Cich, Glenn Debs, Michael 
Dvorak, Mark Grimmenga, 
Thomas Immormino, Patricia 
Jerousek, David Johnson, 
Christopher Kunze, Edward 
Ludwig, Paul Malik, Bernard 
Masterson, Barbara Maurer, 
James McEwan, Denise Misik, 
Ronald Moy, James Mulvey, 
Joseph Mulvey, Nancy Owen, 
Christine Piekarz, John Pingel, 
Joan Podd, Bonnie Price, Bryan 
Price, Paul Puscheck, David Riva, 
Roger Safarik, Jack Sahr, Dennis 
Seccombe, Robert Simek, Lynn 
Solone, John Stack, Guy Thacher, 
Ina Thomas, Paul Trapp, Janedd 
Tuma, Joan Vassar, Richard 
Vega, Richard Vix, Bruce 
Westervelt. 

ELMHURST: Paulette 
Balodimas, Dana Bauchwitz, 
David Booth, William Borger, 
James Camp, Curtis Clifford, 
Arild Egeland, Linda Erpelding, 
Timothy Fullerton, Benny Gay, 
Richard Goodell, Darlene 
Grimestad, Paul Hammel, Steven 
Holtz, George Kacin, Linda 

Kensinger, Michael Kozlowski, 
Charles Lindberg, Gregory Long, 
Susan Morovich, Kenneth North, 
Frank Puglessi, Charles Rizzo, 
Michael Rybinski, Catherine 
Schikora, Victoria Schmelzel, 
Mary Schmuhl, Letha Selig, 
Robert Sinclair, Donald Stephan, 
Mark Swenson, Francis Tocha, 
Victor Uss, Donald Walter, 
William Wanderer, Donald Young. 

GLENDALE HEIGHTS: Vic¬ 
toria Mettevelis. 

GLEN ELLYN: Diann Acker- 
mann, Patricia Baker, James 
Ball, Lawrence Balsamo, Thomas 
Becker, Robert Carlson, Cynthia 
Cooper, Dennis DeRosa, Darol 
Duca, James Goinz, Gary Gregg, 
Frederick Hansen, Peter 
Houghtaling, Steven Hughes, 
James Karum, Peter Kent, 
William Krings, Bruce Larsen, 
Steve Liszak, John Logan, Dorothy 
Mahoney, Richard Malacek, 
Anthony Mendoza, Mark Morris, 
Allen Nus, Charles O’Hara, 
Charles Olson, Dennis Perri, 
Donald Phelps, Marilyn Pizzurro, 
Lee Popovich, Michael Purney, 
Jeffrey Quinn, Barnett Raff, 
Russell Runge, Michael Russo, 
Bruce. Senneke, Ronald Snyder, 
Jon Steging, Rosalinda Stevenson, 
Suzanne Stoll, Lucinda Toye, 
Robert Vasicek, Kenneth Ward, 
Martin Weber, Michael Wesner, 
Norman Wewetzer, Thomas 
Wiprud. 

HICKORY HILLS: Grant 
Steeve. 

Senate passes 4 bills 
The Student Senate passed four 

bills on widely differing topics last 
week, ranging from birth control 
to student involvement. 

John Hrubeck, Tom Stauch, and 
Fred Robinson Jr. submitted a bill 
that Senate no longer appropriate 
the $50 fee for financial 
organization of new clubs. They 
pointed out that the Inter-Club 
Council (ICC) has their own 
financial system, and the ICC 
should put forward loans for new 
clubs when necessary. 

Claude Knuepfer and Barbara 
Bullman submitted a bill that all 
student activities accounts should 
be placed in the contingency fund. 
This will allow remaining monies 
to be spent as considered 
necessary by the comptroller. 

A.S.B. President-elect Fred 
Robinson put forward a bill that 
requirements for senatorship 

WORLDS 

will be available 
in Campus Center 
June 5,8 and 9 
at table, southeast 
corner. This issue 
will be free and 
copies of past 
issues will also be 
available— 

FREE 

dropped from a 12 credit course 
load to “regular enrollment.” This 
is based upon the fact that 60 
percent of the students at C of D 
are part-time and are therefore 
already not eligible for senator- 
ship. 

Senators will still be required to 
maintain a 2 point average to stay 
in office. 

The last of the bills passed 
provided $50 to be spent on the 
purchase of 500 reprints of 
“Bride’s Guide to Birth Control.” 
These reprints are to be 
distributed through the nurse’s 
office. 

PICK UP POEM 

Writers and artists who have 
submitted work to Worlds can go 
through the Material in Worlds 
office, 2nd floor, Farm House on 
Lambert Rd., Thursday, Friday, 
and Monday between 10 a.m. and 
12 noon and 1 to 3 p.m. June 4, 5, 
and 8 if they want their work back. 
Or contact Kathy Ryba at 964-2742 
for information about the same. 

HINSDALE: William Bakos, 
John Bates, Thomas Berthelsen, 
Robert Blood, Theodore Coburn, 
Jon Cudworth, Harold Dehr, Gary 
Filliger, Patricia Flynn, Kenneth 
Hansen, Jeffrey Holub, Deborah 
Kalita, Thomas Meade, James 
Moore, Maureen Mulville, John 
Nordmann, Gary Oldis, Stephen 
Petranek, John Prickett, Richard 
Reineke, Karen Seiferth, Scott 
Smith, John Soltwisch, Paul 
Soustek, William Wallin. 

ITASCA: John Frybarger, John 
Laue, Robert Mrugacz, Paul 
Reynertson, Philip Reynertson, 
Robert Starbuck. 

LA GRANGE: Sandra An¬ 
derson, James Artman, Marianne 
Bardy, David Beyer, Edward 
Block, Dennis Brancato, Richard 
Brown, Donald Doty, Frank Flynn, 
Stephen Gambill, Rudolph 
Gradishar, Mark Heeter, Elsa 
Hughes, Donald Inman, Ginger 
Johnson, David Kautz, Pamela 
Kies, Don Kouba, Mark Kristie, 
Kenneth Ledene, Karl Meacham, 
Glenn Mills, Michael Moon, 
Thomas Murphy, Donald Nelson, 
Steven O’Dell, Kenneth Pagni, 
Judith Pate, James Rega, 
Cathleen Roche, Nancy Roche, 
Edward Rotolo, Geoffrey Ryan, 
Hans-Dieter Schmidt, William 
Schwass, Dennis Shanahan, Judith 
Shepler, Thomas Slampak, Susan 
Smith, Alan Thyer, Jan Van 
Baalen, James Vieira, Joseph 

Wenckowski, Gaylord Whiting, 
Donald Zeman. 

LA GRANGE PARK: Jerry 
Babiar, Paulita Behrman, Michael 
Blanchard, Michael Kurtz, Magda 
Kutasky, Therese Lynch, Mary 
Mandarich, Thomas Mannos, 
George Rylek, Dennis Wolf, 
Lizabeth Zubathy. 

LEMONT: James Mastro, Gary 
Powalisz. 

RIVERSIDE: Roland Cooper, 
David Denk, George Macht, 
Charles Plhak. 

ROLLING MEADOWS: Robert 
Cissik. 

ROSELLE: Sharon Cannon, 
Kenneth Chatterton, Harold 
Jensen, John Lebbing, Michael 
Rybacki, Garett Sager, Dan 
Tobolick. 

LISLE: Thomas Caldwell, 
Douglas Cunningham, Barbara 
Hammer, Michael Hood, Steve 
Kanaba, George Kilens, Donald 
Kvasnicka, Spencer Leigh, Rita 
Levine, Jeffrey Mack, Roger 
Michalek, Elizabeth Pipek, 
Clarence Saul, Bradley Tertell, 
Peter Wilson. 

LOMBARD: Jeffrey Bartels, 
Bruce Blake, Mary Callaghan, 
Loretta Caputo, James Chopores, 
James Coleman, James Eby, 
William Eiger, Michael 
Haberkamp, Dawn Hedlund, Jo 
Ann Hepner, Robert Huml, 
Deborah Hunter, Tranita Jackson, 
Phillip Johnson, Jeffery Kincaid, 
Timothy Kraegel, Heinz Krut- 
zikowsky, David Lane, Lucille 
Lazzara, Terrence Madden, 
Jimmie Mask, Pamela May, Alex 
Metallo, Diana Monti, Sally 
Netwig, Alan Neuschaefer, Lynn 
Overeem, Miles Padalik, Terrence 
Paeth, Judy Peterson, Linda 
Prachar, Karen Rardin, Richard 
Rosenwinkel, Margaret Sheehan, 
John Sojka, Gerald Stephens, 
Bruce Tamulion, Edward Zeissler, 
Gregory Zelazek. 

LONG GROVE: John Ullrich. 

SKOKIE: Mario Corona. 

STICKNEY: Sandra Batke. 
VILLA PARK: Lynn Andrews, 

Catherine Campbell, Richard 
Davis, Ruth Dye, Angela Favia, 
Michael Fleming, Mary Florida, 
Joseph Gabriel, Peter Gormley, 
Robert Haag, Robert Hitchcock, 
Edward Hummel, Richard Kirk¬ 
wood, Richard Kuehl, Dorothy 
Makarevich, Henry Monti, Bruce 
Moses, Thomas Nelson, Terrence 
Olson, Lynette Pierdinock, 
Charles Ragonese, Carl Sandberg, 
Glen Tegtmeier, Robert Vorel, 
Dennis Williamson. 

WARRENVILLE: David Hough, 
Kenneth Jennrich, Jerry Smith, 
Daryl Soukup. 

WEST CHICAGO: Patrick 
Dooley, Gerald Fessler, Glenn 
Koos, Marianne Liebezeit, William 
Sabathne, Roderick Schuett, Ester 
Severe, Donald Zalewa. 

WESTERN SPRINGS: Diane 
Eastman, Jo Ellen Hacquebord, 
Margaret Kalina, Ruth Liakos, 
Robert McGee, Jean Norton, Janet 
Saunders, Henry Sulkowski, 
Patricia Wager, Kathleen Warsh. 

MC HENRY: Donald Voight. 

MEDINAH: Karen Szarz, An¬ 
drew Tangen, Barbara Thompson, 

MELROSE PARK: Charles 
Luepke. 

NAPERVILLE: Linda Baird, 
Jean Balser, Gerald Bensema, Leo 
Breyne, Thomas Breyne, Terrence 
Cohoon, Hillard Collier, Constance 
Cybularz, Edward Doyle, Michael 
Froehlke, Robert Gay, Brian 
Graham, Lynne Greenwood, 
Richard Greenwood, William Guy, 
Arnaldo Iturrieta, Robert Jones, 
Frederick Juhnke, Charles Lin- 
nell, Robert Lowry, Karen 
Malecha, Dennis Matta, Roger 
McConnell, James Murphy, James 
O’Heron, Arthur Pradel, Peter 
Schultz, Michael Seymour, James 
Taggart, Robert Welgos. 

WESTMONT: Ramon Caruso, 
Steven Gajda, William Klass, 
Dorothy Krai, Jill Ludwig, Harold 
Mattes, Rickie Nelson, Mary 
Schiller, Leo Skladany, Danny 
Stine, Donald Treonis, David Watt. 

WHEATON: David Bachorski, 
Karen Barlow, John Belushi, Vicki 
Bergman, Nancy Cellmer, 
Gregory Claricoates, Rachel 
Faught, Leonard Ferguson, Judith 
Fletcher, Janet Ford, Linda Ford, 
Robert Gorskey, Mary Hausten, 
Joyce Hedstrom, Craig Hjorth, 
Harold Hollingsworth, William 
Iverson, Jeffrey Jones, Constance 
Koutselas, Frederick Marciniak, 
Tom Marwedel, Michael Matula, 
Margaret Moore, Andrew Mueller, 
James Nicholson, Alan Nissen, 
Martin O’Rourke, Steven Parsons, 
Dorothy Squitieri, John Struzina, 
Jearld Swanner, Michael Warner. 

OAK BROOK: Barbara Larson, WINFIELD: Catherine Becker, 
Robert Schoff, Bonnie Terlak. Larry Sewell, Gene Walker. 

NORTH RIVERSIDE: Kerry WOODDALE: Victor Chodora, 
Brunette, David Hejtmanek, Dennis Fogarty, Noella Louzen- 
Dennis Kalinoski. - sky, John Pech, William Schey. 
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The Chaparrals voted Dick Malacek and Joe Oliver as their most 
valuable player for the year. Malacek set a DuPage record with 27 

hits and Oliver's 22 RBI's set another record as the Chaparrals 
compiled a 13-7 overall record this season. 
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C of D athletes win 4 conference crowns 
This past academic year has 

been one of the best ever for the 
DuPage athletic teams. Next year 
the college will participate in the 
new conference, the N4C, which 
contains only six of the 24 teams 
that the Chaparrals have* 
previously contested. 

The cross country team, sparked 
by the running of Karl Senser and 
Tom Collins, won the conference 
and regional crowns before 
finishing 15th in the national meet. 
Coach Ron Ottoson’s harriers 
could repeat the performance next 
season as he will retain most of his 
runners. 

The football team which was 
plagued with disciplinary 
problems as well as strategical 
gridiron difficulties rambled their 
record to 2-7. If Mario Corona 
wasn’t on the team the gridders 
may have never won a game. One 
of the wins (against Morton) was 
won almost singlehandedly by 
Corona as his 47 yard TD run and 
his extra point kick was enough to 
beat the Panthers 7-6. 

Meanwhile the Soccer team was 
having its problems in their first 
season of competition, finishing 
with a 3-7 record. Next year 
Webster’s kickers will be a varsity 
sport however instead of a club it 
was this past season. With the 
retention of most of his players 
they should easily improve. 

This year’s golfers finished the 
lowest in the three years Herb 
Salberg has coached them. With 
conference medalist Mike Feltz 
and Carmen Molinaro gone the 

golfers may be headed for a more 
dismal season next year. 

In winter competition the run¬ 
ners socred their second con¬ 
ference victory as the indoor track 
team beat Wright and Kennedy- 
King for the honors. 

The cagers improved on last 
year’s record and have plans to do 
the same next year providing Jim 
Belanger, this year’s most 
valuable player stays with the 
club. 

In their first year of competition 
the gymnasts produced the first 
national champion in Don Gar¬ 
diner. Together with Tom Sinon, 
the gymnasts managed an 8-5-1 
season in Dave Webster’s capable 
controls. 

A1 Zamsky’s swimmers 
managed a conference title before 
they fizzled in national com¬ 
petition. Denny Gardiner and John 
Brajenovich scored high for the 
tankmen all season and were the 
only scorers in the national meet. 

Coach A1 Kaltofen finished in 
fine fashion with his wrestling 
crew and sent Dave Hejtmanek 
the nationals after Dave won his 
conference and regional crowns at 
134 pounds. 

Herb Salberg’s icemen went 
undefeated until the last game of 
the season and finished wtih a 13-1 
record behind the top scoring first 
line of Jim Nelson, Lee Popovich 
and Art Tessman. Tessman, one of 
the fastest skaters on the club, will 
captain the team next year in 
hopes of going undefeated. 

First Class Mail 
U. S. Postage 

PAID 
Glen Ellyn. III. 
Petroit Ho. 164 
Non-Profit Org. 

The spring season was probably 
the best for DuPage teams as the 
baseball team took the conference 
title with a 13-1 romp over Wright. 
Joe Oliver and Dick Malacek were 
co-MVP’s of John Person’s 
champions although everyone 
helped in winning the title. 

The spring tracksters finished in 
second place and sent five runners 
to the national meet. 

Coach Dave Webster’s tennis 
squad finished their season with an 
8-2 record. 

INTERESTED IN 

COLLEGE TRANSFER THIS FALL? 

We serve as an admitting' resource for a represen¬ 
tative group of fully accredited liberal colleges and 
universities in the midwest who have late fall 
vacancies. Students can be admitted directly through 
our Chicago offices in many cases. Interested students 

should make an appointment with admissions coun¬ 
selors by calling our Chicago office. 

EDUCATIONAL SEARCH CORPORATION 

208 South La Salle Street 
Chicago, Illinois 60604 
PHONE: 782-2300 

Suite 775 

Jean-Luc Godard 
(HI 
Black Power 
Rape 
Murder 
Fascism 
Add 
Pornography 
Sex 
Gore 
Brutality 
and all the other things that make life worth living. 
Godard's new filnfSympathy for the Devil" 
starring The Rolling Stones nas its - premiere 

l June 6 
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at 

n')LLEGE 
jF 
DU PAGE 

LAMBERT RO. & 22ND. ST. 
(1 MILE SOUTH 

OF ROOSEVELT RD.) 
GLEN ELLYN, ILL. 

AOM. .50 
INFORMATION - 858-MOO-•»' 749 
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